
Come Dance and Play the Arkansas Way
Join us in Springdale, Arkansas, July 9-12, 2025, as we will dance at a new venue for 
the 49th ICBDA Convention.  Arkansas is known as the Natural State and Springdale 
has many outdoor activities. 

If you are able to arrive early, join us on Tuesday evening, July 8, for the Trail-In Dance. 
During the convention, we will again offer 3 halls for your dancing pleasure, Phase 3-4, 
4-5 and 5-6 with two mornings of clinics, four days of dance teaches and evening party 
dances.  For dancers, both returning and new, you can look forward to learning new 
dances and improving your technique throughout the convention from our excellent 
instructors.  If you are a new attendee to ICBDA we look forward to meeting you and 
welcoming you into our dance family.  Don’t hesitate to contact us if you have any 
questions.

Our host hotel is the Holiday Inn, next to the Northwest Arkansas Convention Center, 
1500 South 48th Street, Springdale, AR 72762. The hotel guest rooms are located 
around an atrium where you can relax and meet with friends or enjoy something to eat 
and drink at the two restaurants located in the Hotel.  Included in your daily room rate 
are two tickets per room to use at the Tiffany Grille for breakfast.  The host hotel offers 
free parking and WIFI access along with a pool and fitness center.   

Other restaurants are available within walking distance (less than a mile away) and 
include fast food and sit-down dining. There are approximately 10 restaurants less than 
0.5 miles away from the Convention Center and another 10 restaurants about a mile 
away.

If you need to pick up something while you are at the convention, there is a Walmart 
Supercenter about 1.5 miles and an ALDI Grocery store about 2 miles away.
 
The closest airport is the Northwest Arkansas National Airport (XNA) and is located 
about 12 miles from the hotel. Rental Cars are available at the airport or you can catch 
an Uber/Lyft to the hotel. 

If you have time to extend your stay in Springdale, there are hiking and biking trails, 
several State Parks or drive a short distance to nearby Bentonville, which is the home of 
the Crystal Bridges Museum of American Art which offers stunning architecture and 
features masterworks spanning five decades. You can find out more about Springdale at 
the following link, Explore Springdale 
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